
Coaching Process and Disclaimer:  
Coaching is designed to guide the Client to learn how to consistently achieve results and make 
purposeful choices. Client agrees to communicate honestly, be open to feedback and 
assistance and create the time and energy to participate fully in the coaching program. 
However, due to the subjective nature of the work, Client understands and agrees, that the 
Coach makes no guarantee as to the results Client will achieve, nor is the Coach responsible for 
the results achieved by the Client from the coaching.  
 
Client understands that coaching is NOT therapy and is not a substitute for therapy if needed, 
and does not prevent, cure, or treat any mental disorder or medical disease. 
 
Emergencies:  
If there is a medical emergency - physical or psychological, DO NOT CONTACT THE COACH’S 
OFFICE. Emergency issues must be addressed directly by your doctor or therapist, or by dialing 
911 emergency services if warranted.  
 
Confidentiality and Privacy Agreement:  
In order to make this service enjoyable and therapeutic for all who participate, it is necessary 
that both Coach and Client agree to abide by all the rules listed below. Coach agrees to 
maintain complete anonymity of all Client information disclosed or received from any third party 
unless permission is received.  
 
If it is necessary for the Coach to gain access to information from schools, therapists, physicians 
or other professionals, Coach will provide a standard information release form for signature by 
the Client.  
 
However, the terms of anonymity shall not apply where failure to disclose may be, in the 
Coach’s sole discretion, in violation of any law or may involve information regarding certain 
crimes that have either been committed or Coach believes may be committed, or when such 
information is subject to subpoena.  
 
Coach and Client agree that Group is a safe space for members to exchange ideas, opinions 
and comments in support of each other and their shared concerns.  
 
During Client membership in a Positive Focus Coaching Group, Client may learn personal and 
confidential information about individuals who participate or are involved with this Group. 
Whether information is available to Client through the Group or accidentally, Client agrees to 
maintain confidentiality and not reveal information to any person in the Group or outside the 
Group while Client is a Member of the Group or at any time in the future when Client may no 
longer be a Member of the Group. Client understands that breaking this agreement could result 
in the termination of Client’s membership with the Positive Focus Coaching Group.  
 
Although good faith efforts have been taken to preserve participant confidentiality, Positive 
Focus Coach makes no guarantees in this regard or to information communicated by and 
between participants in this forum. This provision (privacy) will survive expiration or termination of 
the Agreement.  
 
This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement of the parties, and reflects a complete 
understanding of the parties with respect to the subject matter and supersedes all prior written 
and oral representations, communications or agreements. The parties agree that this Agreement 
shall be deemed to have been signed and performed in the District of Columbia; and the laws 
of the District of Columbia will control herein. 


